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COMPANY NAME OF BIDDER
Liquid 

Aluminum 
Sulfate

Sodium 
Bisulfate

Dense 
Soda Ash

Bulk Hydrated 
Lime

Powdered 
Activated 
Carbon                                                  

50 lb bag

Powdered 
Activated 
Carbon                    
1,000 lb 

sack

Sodium 
Silica 

Fluoride 
(Prayon 
material 

only)

Copper 
Sulfate 
Med. 

Crystal

Phosphoric 
Acid 36% 

PO4

Sodium 
Hydroxide 

25%

Sodium 
Hypochlorit

e 12.5%                                                         
200-300 gal 

drum 

Sodium 
Hypochlorit

e 12.5%                                                         
55 gal drum 

Sodium 
Hypochlorite 

12.5%                                                   
Bulk tanker

Caustic 
Soda 20%

Polymer, 
Ashland 
Praestol 
K144L

Polymer  – 
SE-365

Polymer 
CedarFloc 

504  

Polymer  – 
K274L

Filter Press 
Polymer 

Sulfuric 
Acid 78% 

Bulk 
tanker

Sulfuric 
Acid 78%                  

Tote

Ferric 
Sulfate 
liquid 

Purate 
bulk

Purate 
tote

Aluminum 
Chlorohydra

te

/ dry ton / lb / lb / lb / lb / lb / lb / lb / gal / lb / lb / gal / gal / lb  / lb / lb / lb / lb / lb / gal / lb  / lb of 
iron EE / lb / lb / lb

Affinity Chemical, LLC 455.00$ 

Allied Universal Corporation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Azure Water Services, LLC 0.79$    1.21$    

Brenntag Mid-South 0.334$   0.675$   0.675$   1.385$   2.628$   0.2178$  0.365$   3.00$     1.85$       0.1731$  2.133$  0.199$  

C&S Chemicals 465.00$ 

CarbPure Technologies 1.25$     

Carus, LLC 6.901$    

Cedarchem, LLC 1.61$       1.81$    

Chemrite, Inc. 1.78$     2.68$      $     8.89 

Chemtrade Chemicals US, LLC 349.00$ 2.042$  0.3365$  

Cheney Lime & Cement Co, Inc. 0.148535$ 

Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. 0.31$     0.26$      0.26$     2.65$     0.16$      

DPC Enterprises, L.P. 1.745$     

G2O Technologies, LLC 538.81$ 0.409$    

International Dioxide Inc.  Non-
Resp. 

 Non-
Resp. 

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc 1.614$  

Lhoist North America 0.1481$     

Mississippi Lime Co. 0.1366$     

Pencco 1.68$    

Polydyne, Inc.  $     1.60 1.60$    1.60$     

Shannon Chemical Corporation 12.74$    

Solenis LLC 1.50$     1.70$    1.70$     

Southern States Chemical 2.12$    

Specialty Chemical Co. LLC 0.3279$ 0.283$   0.5145$  0.3585$  3.64$      Non-Resp. 

Sterling Water Technologies, LLC 4.8910$  2.8393$  1.2291$  

Thatcher Chemical of Florida, Inc. 1.39$    

Univar Solutions 0.3611$  1.1812$ 1.2700$ 0.9453$  2.9697$  0.2560$  0.2833$  2.9700$  0.1676$  

Vineera Chemicals 2.66$     

Lowest Bid Amounts:   349.000$  0.3279$    0.283$      0.1366$        0.675$      0.675$      0.9453$    2.628$      4.8910$     0.2178$     0.26$        2.65$        1.745$        0.16$         1.50$        1.60$      1.61$          1.70$      1.2291$    2.12$      0.199$    1.39$      0.79$      1.21$      0.3365$     

Lowest Bidders:
Chemtrade 
Chemicals 
US, LLC

Specialty 
Chemical 
Co. LLC

Specialty 
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Mississippi 
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Mid-South

Univar 
Solutions

Brenntag 
Mid-South

Sterling 
Water 

Technologie
s, LLC
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Mid-South

Colonial 
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Solutions, 

Inc.
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